
From: Yelena S
To: foil
Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] 19 Vera Street - 60628607-0 Water Bill
Date: Tuesday, April 22, 2025 9:42:41 AM

Hi,

Please assist with below.

Regards
Mary

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Erica L. Jankiewicz <ejankiewicz@ecwa.org>
Date: Tue, Apr 22, 2025 at 1:08 PM
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] 19 Vera Street - 60628607-0 Water Bill
To: Yelena S <managerabsenterprisellc@gmail.com>, Joseph DiMarco
<jdimarco@ecwa.org>

Good morning,

You will need to make this request through the Freedom of Information process. Please email our
FOIL Officer at foil@ecwa.org.

Kind regards,

Erica Jankiewicz

Assistant Business Office Manager

Erie County Water Authority

P: 716-849-8444

ejankiewicz@ecwa.org

From: Yelena S <managerabsenterprisellc@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, April 21, 2025 4:57 PM
To: Erica L. Jankiewicz <ejankiewicz@ecwa.org>; Joseph DiMarco <jdimarco@ecwa.org>
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This message was sent from outside the organization. Do not open links or attachments unless you recognize the
source of this email and know the content is safe.

  

Subject: [EXTERNAL] 19 Vera Street - 60628607-0 Water Bill

 

Hi, 

 

Good day. Can you please assist with water bill invoices and payment on the account
below from August 1, 2024 to date?

60628607-0

Regards

Mary

 

--

 

 

Phone: 716-7917754

Fax: 877-532-0614

 

ABS ENTERPRISE, LLC

2885 Sanford Ave SW, #22012

Grandville MI 49418

Confidentiality Notice: This electronic mail transmission is intended for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may
contain confidential information belonging to the sender which is protected by the attorney-client privilege/or otherwise. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or the taking of any action in reliance on the contents
of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail and
delete the original message. Thank you for your cooperation.

-- 
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Fax: 877-532-0614

ABS ENTERPRISE, LLC
2885 Sanford Ave SW, #22012
Grandville MI 49418


